MIAMI-DADE

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY
COUNTY

PRODUCT CONTROL SECTION

11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208
DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER) Miami, Florida 33175-2474
BOARD AND CODE ADMINISTRATION DIVISION T (786) 3152590  F (786) 315-2599

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE (NOA) www.miamidade.gov/economy

Tecnoglass, LLLC
3550 NW 49 Street
Miami, FL 33142

Scork:

This NOA is being issued under the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of construction
materials. The documentation submitted has been reviewed and accepted by Miami—Dade County RER—
Product Control Section to be used in Miami—Dade County and other areas where allowed by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction (AHJ).

This NOA shall not be valid after the expiration date stated below. The Miami—Dade County Product Control
Section (In Miami—Dade County) and/or the AHJ (in areas other than Miami—Dade County) reserve the right
to have this product or material tested for quality assurance purposes. If this product or material fails to perform
in the accepted manner, the manufacturer will incur the expense of such testing and the AHJ may immediately
revoke, modify, or suspend the use of such product or material within their jurisdiction. RER reserves the
right to revoke this acceptance if it is determined by Miami—Dade County Product Control Section that this
product or material fails to meet the requirements of the applicable building code.

This product is approved as described herein and has been designed to comply with the Florida Building Code,
including the High Velocity Hurricane Zone.

DESCRIPTION: Series “PH-4400” Aluminum Single Hung Window — L.M.I.

APPROVAL DOCUMENT: Drawing No. W08-78, titled “Series PH4400 Alum Single Hung Window
(L.M.1)”, sheets 1 through 9 of 9, dated 09/10/08, with revision F dated 09/20/23, prepared by Al-Farooq
Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E., bearing the Miami-Dade County Product Control
Renewal stamp with the Notice of Acceptance number and expiration date by the Miami—Dade County
Product Control Section.

MISSILE IMPACT RATING: Large and Small Missile Impact Resistant.

LABELING: Each unit shall bear a permanent label with the manufacturer's name or logo, Barranquilla,
Colombia S.A., series and following statement: "Miami—Dade County Product Control Approved" unless
otherwise noted herein.

RENEWAL of this NOA shall be considered after a renewal application has been filed and there has been
no change in the applicable building code negatively affecting the performance of this product.

TERMINATION of this NOA will occur after the expiration date or if there has been a revision or change
in the materials, use, and/ or manufacture of the product or process. Misuse of this NOA as an endorsement
of any product, for sales, advertising or any other purposes shall automatically terminate this NOA. Failure to
comply with any section of this NOA shall be cause for termination and removal of NOA.
ADVERTISEMENT: The NOA number preceded by the words Miami—Dade County, Florida, and followed
by the expiration date may be displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the NOA is displayed, then
it shall be done in its entirety.

INSPECTION: A copy of this entire NOA shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or its distributors
and shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.

This NOA renews NOA No. 23-0928.08 and consists of this page 1, evidence pages E-1, E-2, and E-3, as
well as approval document mentioned above.

The submitted documentation was reviewed by Manuel Perez, P.E.

NOA No. 24-1206.01
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY ol .
Expiration Date: October 25, 2025

Approval Date: January 23, 2025
1/13/25 Page 1


http://www.miamidade.gov/economy

Tecnoglass, LL.C

[y

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s
DRAWINGS

1.

2.

Manufacturer's die drawings and sections.

(Submitted under NOA No. 09-0604.21)

Drawing No. W08-78, titled “Series PH4400 Alum Single Hung Window (L.M.L.)”,
sheets 1 through 9 of 9, dated 09/10/08, with revision F dated 09/20/23, prepared by Al-
Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 23-0928.08)

TESTS

1.

Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94

6) Kinetic Energy Drop Load Test, (400 Ft. Lb.) per ANSI Z97.1
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of Series PH4400 Aluminum
Single Hung Window, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test Report
No. FTL-5470, dated 03/20/08, signed and sealed by Carlos S. Rionda, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 09-0604.21)
Test reports on: 1) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

2) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94

3) Kinetic Energy Drop Load Test, (400 Ft. Lb.) per ANSI Z97.1
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of Series PH4400 Aluminum
Single Hung Window, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test Report
No. FTL-5469, dated 02/19/08, signed and sealed by Carlos S. Rionda, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 09-0604.21)
Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of Series PH4400 Aluminum
Single Hung Window, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test Report
No. FTL-5155, dated 02/27/07, signed and sealed by Carlos S. Rionda, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 09-0604.21)

CALCULATIONS

1.

Anchor verification and structural analysis complying with FBC 6" Edition (2017)
dated 07/03/18, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Javad
Ahmad, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 16-0510.07)

Manuel Perez, P.E.
Product Control Exa

Expiration Date: October 25;
Approval Date: January 23, 2025



Tecnoglass, LL.C

[y

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s (CONTINUED)
QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER)

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 22-1116.01 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers” dated 12/15/22, expiring on
07/04/28.

STATEMENTS

1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 7t Edition (2020), with FBC

8t Edition (2023) and of no financial interest, dated September 22, 2023, issued by
Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 23-0928.08)

2. Letter from Professional Engineer requesting a 1-year extension to allow time to
perform verification test, dated September 22, 2023, signed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 23-0928.08)

3. Testing agreement letter dated September 27, 2023, between QAI Laboratories, Inc.
(QAI) and E.S. Windows, LLC, issued by QAI and signed by Lusinda Delgado,
Technical Report Writer.

(Submitted under NOA No. 23-0928.08)

4. Asset purchase agreement dated 06/19/14, signed by Mr. Raul Casares, for and on
behalf of R.C. Aluminum Industries, Inc. and Mr. José M. Daes, for and on behalf of
Tecnoglass, LLC.

(Submitted under NOA No. 16-0510.07)

5. Statement letter dated 07/15/14, issued by R.C. Aluminum Industries, Inc. of sales of
asset and relinquishing of all rights of NOA No. 12-0330.11, signed by Raul Casares,
for and on behalf of R.C. Aluminum Industries, Inc.

(Submitted under NOA No. 16-0510.07)

6. Department of State Certification of TECNOGLASS, LLC as a limited liability
company, active and organized under the laws of the State of Florida, dated 03/03/14
and signed by Ken Detzner, Secretary of State.

(Submitted under NOA No. 16-0510.07)

OTHERS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 21-0405.19, issued to Tecnoglass, LLC., for their Series
“PH4400” Aluminum Single Hung Window — L.M.L.”, approved on 08/12/21 and
expiring on 10/25/23.

2. This is a one-year approval, subjected to successful verification test, the final approval
will be issued for a total of 5 years.

Manuel Perez, P.E.
Product Control Exa r
NOA No. 24—1’2;?.-;
Expiration Date: October 25; 5
Approval Date: January 23, 2025



http://en.wikipedia.org/w/index.php?title=Ken_Detzner&action=edit&redlink=1

Tecnoglass, LL.C

(S

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

NEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED
DRAWINGS

1.

None.

TESTS

1.

None.

CALCULATIONS

1.

None.

QUALITY ASSURANCE

1.

Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 23-0717.30 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers” dated 08/31/23, expiring on
07/04/28.

STATEMENTS

1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 8t Edition (2023) and of no
financial interest, dated December 6, 2024, issued by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed
and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

2. Letter from Professional Engineer requesting a 1-year extension to allow time to
perform verification test, dated December 6, 2024, signed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

3. Testing agreement letter dated December 5, 2024, between IFET, Inc. and E.S.
Windows, LLC, issued by IFET, Inc. and signed by Luis Macias, CEO - IFET, Inc.

OTHERS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 23-0928.08, issued to Tecnoglass, LLC., for their Series
“PH-4400” Aluminum Single Hung Window — L.M.1.”, approved on 10/26/23 and
expiring on 10/25/24.

2. This is a one-year approval, subjected to successful verification test, the final approval

will be issued for a total of 5 years.

Manuel Perez, P.E.
Product Control Exa

Expiration Date: October 25;
Approval Date: January 23, 2025



~

[SERIES PH4400 ALUM SINGLE HUNG WINDOW (L.M.i.)j

|

)

-1/4" TEMP. GLASS —1/4” TEMP. GLASS EQUAL LITES SINGLE HUNG WINDOWS 48"
WINDOW FRAME WIDTH
1/2" AR SPACE 1/2" AR SPACE DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF y
42 7/8"
1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS 1/4” HEAT STREN'D GLASS WINDOW DIMS. INSUL. LAM. GLASS 5 oPG
WIDTH | HEIGHT EXT.(+) | INT.(=) - :
.090" Interlayer .090" Interlayer "
SentryGlas SentryGlas 36 120.0 120.0
By 'Kuraray America, Inc.’ By 'Kuraray America, Inc.’ 42" 45" 120.0 120.0 5
1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS 1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS 487 1050 105.0 I T O O
54" 88.6 88.6
w w 36" 120.0 120.0 — +—
£ 5 5 42" , 120.0 120.0 g .
S . Slo 48" >4 97.9 97.9 3 ow 38
28 O 2nd @ : ' ' L85 ] 7 2
CON / w5 54 82.0 82.0 © © e 5 kS
, ﬂl b ¢ 36" 120.0 120.0 N 1 4 T
| " = 0
( 5 42 116.3 116.3 p o}
]
B X / 48" 60" 82.6 92.6 = |
S S 54" 76.9 76.9 2| I —
& = 36" 120.0 120.0 -
E= > . - ~ i
= % 42" . 112.9 112.9 ] —t v —
FiX. LITE S.H., VENT Y 66 o |E ys
E— e 48 88.7 88.7 ©Q 7
” z <& 6N ,
54 73.0 73.0 S 3% s et
GLAZING DETAIL - — — R NG —
1-1/4" OVERALL LAM. INSUL. GLASS 1/2” AIR SPACE CONSISTING OF: 30 : - ©iT N©
427 72" 111.1 111.1 NEEE
SPACER: . PG e ok 42 7/8" MAX —
"HELIMA’ LOW PROFILE ALUMINUM SPACER 48 85.9 85.9 DS T
BY ‘LINGERMANN GMBH’ 36" 1200 120.0 @ e
AROUND THE PERIMETER OF THE GLASS. 42" 78" 110.7 110.7 — 5/ +—
PERIMETER SEALANT: 48" 84.0 84.0 ] —g
THESE WINDOWS ARE RATED FOR LARGE & SMALL MISSILE IMPACT. SILICONE 36" - 120.0 120.0 ] FT T T T T 1 l "
SHUTTERS ARE NOT REQUIRED. DOWSIL 882 40 84 1107 1107 2 5/8" MAX. L"“I Xlpk
- - HEAD/SILL ” S=z
36" 90" 120.0 120.0 CORIQ/ERS | 7 MAX. :@gg
" [&]
SERIES PH4400 42 o7 | 1107 45 1/47 UAX |
ALUMINUM SINGLE HUNG WINDOW 36" 96” 1200 120.0 VENT WIDTH ‘
36" 102" 120.0 120.0
APPROVAL APPLIES TO SINGLE UNITS OR SIDE BY SIDE COMBINATIONS TYPICAL ELEVATION
OF S.H. TO S.H. OR S.H./FIX. TO S.H./FIX. IN MODULES OF TWO OR EQUAL LITES
MORE WINDOWS USING MIAMI-DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS IN S.H. WINDOWS
BETWEEN. %
FOR WINDOWS CAPACITY SEE CHARTS ON SHEETS 1 THRU 3. i DAYLITE OPENINGS:
FOR MULLION CAPACITY SEE CHART ON SHEET 4. - DLO WIDTH = FRAME WIDTH — 5.125 (FIX. LITE)
LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM WINDOW CAPACITY CHART OR o DLO WIDTH = FRAME WIDTH — 5.125 (VENT)
MULLION CAPACITY CHART WILL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM. T
ﬁ DLO HEIGHT = VENT HEIGHT — 6.313
THIS PRODUCT HAS BEEN DESIGNED AND TESTED TO COMPLY WITH THE 2 VENT WIDTH = FRAME WIDTH — 2.75
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020 (7TH EDITION)/2023 (8TH EDITION) FLORIDA 7
BUILDING CODE INCLUDING HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE (HVHZ).
1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS & BUCK FASTENERS BY OTHERS, MUST BE PRODUCT COMPLIES WITH REQUIREMENTS OF ANSI 797.1.
DESIGNED AND INSTALLED ADEQUATELY TO TRANSFER APPLIED PRODUCT WIDTH SAFEGUARD REQUIREMENTS TO BE VERIFIED.
LOADS TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.
ANCHORS SHALL BE CORROSION RESISTANT, SPACED AS SHOWN ON DETAILS EQUAL LITES INSUL. LAM. GLASS

AND INSTALLED PER MANUF'S INSTRUCTIONS. SPECIFIED EMBEDMENT TO BASE
MATERIAL SHALL BE BEYOND WALL DRESSING OR STUCCO.

A LOAD DURATION INCREASE IS USED IN DESIGN OF ANCHORS INTO WOOD ONLY.
ALL SHIMS TO BE HIGH IMPACT, NON—~METALLIC AND NON—-COMPRESSIBLE.

MATERIALS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO STEEL/METAL SCREWS, THAT
COME INTO CONTACT WITH OTHER DISSIMILAR MATERIALS SHALL MEET THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020/2023 FLORIDA BLDG. CODE & ADOPTED STANDARDS.

THIS PRODUCT APPROVAL IS GENERIC AND DOES NOT PROVIDE INFORMATION
FOR A SITE SPECIFIC PROJECT, i.e. LIFE SAFETY OF THIS PRODUCT, ADEQUACY
OF STRUCTURE RECEIVING THIS PRODUCT AND SEALING AROUND OPENING FOR
WATER INFILTRATION RESISTANCE ETC.

CONDITIONS NOT SHOWN IN THIS DRAWING ARE TO BE ANALYZED SEPARATELY,
AND TO BE REVIEWED BY BUILDING OFFICIAL.

DESIGN LOADS SHOWN ARE BASED ON ‘ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN (ASD)'.

SINGLE HUNG WINDOWS
PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-1206.01

Expiration Date: %0/25/2025
By:gW A0

NOTE: Miami/—‘pade ProductTontrol

GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAO5-DEC-219

PRODUCT REVISED LARGE MISSILE IMPACT

(revisions:

As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0928.08

Expiration Date: 10/25/2024
By:QW

Miami/—Pade Produc,t’Co}trol
qp 22 13

o
(C.AN. 3538) fC
COMP—ANL\WO08~78RC )

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-81.00

=

|

FAX. (305) 638—5158

3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

TECNOGLASS, LLC

REV. PER RER COMMENTS
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
UPDATED TO 2023 FBC

by [ description

D 109.25.18
E 111.18.20

C (041417
F 108.20.23

nol date

|

09-10-08

I=]
A
-
i
o~
™~
-
B
o
3]
@

date:

dr. by: TARIQ

chk. by:

TN,
drawing no.

W08-78

sheet 1 of Q



mp045
noa23-0928.08

Manny Perez
noa24-1206.01


EQUAL LITES SINGLE HUNG/FIXED WINDOWS

DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF

WINDOW DIMS.

INSUL. LAM. GLASS

WIDTH S.H. HT. HEIGHT EXT.(+) ?NT.(-—)
36" 120.0 120.0
42 48" 79" 120.0 120.0
48" 105.0 105.0
54" 88.6 88.6
36" 120.0 120.0
42" . ., 120.0 120.0

54 81
48" - 97.9 97.9
54" 82.0 82.0
36" 120.0 120.0
42" 116.3 116.3
48" 60" 90" 92.6 92.6
547 76.9 76.9
36" 120.0 120.0
42" ., . 112.9 112.9
66 99
48" 88.7 88.7
54" 73.0 73.0
36" 120.0 120.0
42" 72" 108" 111.1 1111
48" 85.9 85.9
38" 120.0 120.0
42" 78" 1177 110.7 110.7
48" 84.0 84.0
36" 120.0 120.0
42" 80" 120" 110.7 110.7
48" 84.0 84.0
7
2
i
-~
xI
£
-
5= T
il s
T 8 Z
e
%
s
WIDTH
EQUAL LITES
SINGLE HUNG/FIXED WINDOWS
NOTE:
FOR ANSI 797.1 COMPLIANCE LIMIT

MAX. WIDTHS TO 48"

NOTE:

GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAO5-—DEC-219

FALSE MUNTINS
(SURFACE APPLIED)

48"

MAY BE USED

WINDOW FRAME WIDTH

42 7/8"

S D.L. OPG.
5

35 7/8"
D.L. OPG

119 1/27 MAX.

JAMBS

DAYLITE OPENINGS:
FRAME WIDTH — 5.125 (FIX. LITE)
FRAME WIDTH — 5.125 (VENT)

]

VENT HEIGHT - 6.313

FRAME WIDTH - 2.75
PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

24-1206.01

Expiration Date: %0/25/2025
By:gW A0

Miami/—‘pade ProductTontrol

= . 42 7/8" MAX.
o | /6N D.L. OPG.
<<
Lid I I NG o —_t
2 9 N o
N ool
L () p— £l
s @ 7 45 1/4" MAX.
g ¥ D\ VENT WIDTH
Z L 5 s
= s
b It
@ if s I
R SO i ‘
< |9 Lo
I [ T B Lol U
_____ Fetf=gmomos
Q0 |~ p— Ij t
Min §' 1l
i 1l
< 3 } } I
— 5 /4 il -
1
- I}
" [ R ,
2 5/8" MAX. %
HEAD/SILL 7" MAX. =
CORNERS HEAD/SILL ©
7" MAX.

TYPICAL ELEVATION

EQUAL LITES

S.H./FIX. WDV.

PRODUCT REVISED

As complying with the Florida
23-0928.08

Building Code
NOA-No.

Expiration Date: 10/25/2024
By'QW

Miami/—Pade Produc,t’Co}trol
S222mMm

JAMB
CORNERS

O
oo
© )
oo
=
—~
o
2, B4
E S eZ
Ed .8
z2 2o
<E NS
[N <&
m D'IOO
Col oo
Cug ¢
> N ;
o, %
o w
=3
Qoap
ORud
628
(o B 0~NV -1
o o
on.ﬂg\-i
0%z <
mmwgg
[+ A |
qUSL g
u_wm_:o
T Zp0E 0
288z
Loz ¥
R
(G
—
= it
= P
i
2 2
[ [ie]
=
= o
(o]
g s
% R
>
b= <
w QW w
Ol
Z|0x
[ e N
- -wvr:n
9] -
200y
5.78
glaz ;5
I Q4
FiIOoO=zw5
oz -8
LICB=Y
= <
&= n =
ik m = e
CTTTTTTTTTTTTTTTD
N
[
-
gl
2T |X
21 w
S jol
o@g@
SN
ol i 2w
Q.2 .12
Clul=g gl
olaiz gz
Bl ICIZ1°
maoao
jxri iz 22
>
LY
A MREIIE
O»—Q—A"!’II)@O
O N e
2°gi8 -8
é\goomm—-
w0l o
RN
5l e
N
S>>
-
Flg s
IR RN
|
T T TN
drawing no.

isheet 2 of @



mp045
noa23-0928.08

Manny Perez
noa24-1206.01


UNEQUAL LITES SINGLE HUNG WINDOWS 48" 48"
UNEQUAL LITES SINGLE HUNG/FIXED WINDOWS WINDOW FRAME WIDTH WINDOW FRAME WIDTH
DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF 42 7/8" FALSE MUNTINS 42 7/8"
INSUL. LAM. GLASS DL OPG. (SURFACE APPLIED) . D.L OFG.
WINDOW DIMS. 42-3/16” VENT HT.| 36-3/16” VENT HT. | 30-3/16” VENT HT. | 24-3/16” VENT HT. @ MAY BE USED @
WIDTH HEIGHT EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | l | l [ | l [ | I
36" 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0
42" 84" 110.7 110.7 111.6 111.6 115.3 115.3 120.0 120.0 ] ’ ’ . ] . L
48" 83.3 83.3 85.4 85.4 89.3 89.3 95.5 95.5 I I :; ;‘
54" ~ - 68.1 68.1 71.7 71.7 76.9 76.9 T H § - FN— ! I
36 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 & soodloaoo oo \&8/ S S |
42" 90° 110.7 110.7 111.6 111.6 115.3 115.3 120.0 120.0 1 ! | n ] i I
48" 83.3 83.3 85.4 85.4 89.3 89.3 95.5 95.5 ) ! | i ;/ i
547 - - 68.1 68.1 71.7 71.7 76.9 76.9 § w (P oo
36" 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 . &5 :::::il::;//::g::::: — - s
42" - 1107 110.7 1116 111.6 115.3 115.3 120.0 120.0 > | IR S ———
48" 83.3 83.3 85.4 85.4 89.3 89.3 95.5 95.5 = 77 I I - = —] | !
54” - - 68.1 68.1 71.7 71.7 - = <18 | I . 1S ! |
36 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 1200 | % i ] i l N §§ 2 ] }; !
42" 102" 110.7 110.7 111.6 111.6 115.3 115.3 120.0 120.0 Q?é 7::%;::::::?%::: 9 5 =Q§
48" 83.3 83.3 85.4 85.4 89.3 89.3 95.5 95.5 =& —] N ! I G e
54 - - 68.1 68.1 - ~ - - 2z ! ! 212 ] .
36" 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 1200 | é ‘! ' N - § 4201’/80,32“’ %
42" 108" 110.7 110.7 111.6 111.6 115.3 115.3 119.6 119.6 = ] - = g o ,®— D =
48” 83.3 83.3 85.4 85.4 89.3 89.3 - - . g ® ég =
36" 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 —t ;/ — N N — —
42" 1147 110.7 110.7 111.6 111.6 115.3 1153 - - % N 7 : § Mg 45 1/4" MAX.
48" 83.3 83.3 85.4 85.4 - - - - =15 % 96— / J ¥ ] VENT WIDTH
36" 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 ©|f O @
42" 120" 1107 1107 111.6 111.6 - - - - k% 912 . 42 7/8" WAX L
48" 83.3 83.3 - - - - - - AR S oPe :
RIS - e 7 S,
' T T T T 1
P 2 5/8" MAX. N 25@;% 2 5/8” MAX.
) 7 HEAD/SILL l 77 MAX. =2z HEAD/SILL 77 MAX.
% CORNERS . © 8 CORNERS HEAD/SILL
% I 45 1/4" MAX. 7" MAX.
5= = VENT WIDTH
£ TR TYPICAL ELEVATION TYPICAL ELEVATION
- @ UNEQUAL LITES (ORIEL TYPE) UNEQUAL LITES
= z i S.H. WINDOWS S.H./FIX. WDW.
T >
. 7 /
> 7 % DAYLITE OPENINGS:
4 DLO WIDTH = FRAME WIDTH — 5.125 (FIX. LITE)
PRODUCT RENEWED DLO WIDTH = FRAME WIDTH — 5.125 (VENT)
WioTH wioTH as complying with the Florida DLO HEIGHT = VENT HEIGHT - 6.313 ~ PRODUCT REVISED

JAMBS

Building Code

NOA-No.

UNEQUAL LITES (ORIEL) UNEQUAL LITES (ORIEL)

24-1206.01

SINGLE HUNG WINDOWS SINGLE HUNG/FIXED WINDOWS

NOTE:
FOR ANSI Z97.1 COMPLIANCE LIMIT Miami/—‘pade ProductControl
MAX. WIDTHS TO 48" NOTE:

Expiration Date: %0/25/2025
By:E_W M}.

FRAME WIDTH - 2.75

GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAO0S5-DEC-219

As complying with the Florida
23-0928.08

Building Code
NOA-No.

Expiration Date: 10/25/2024
Bymmw@ﬁw

Miami/—Pade Produc,t’Co}trol

S 22203

€

7N
&)
Yo ¥ |5
)
© D
©
g
Y
Z 3R~
95 202
N
Pm Z'w(l
<E T NS
e S glo
on&-’__oU
Quy ¢
>N ¢
Loy %
fFor w
3
Qoap
Q2,5
8>m
&Sm0
[l 4 &
on.cg\-«
0Lz 4
mwwog
xz 2
guUsi g
u_%w_'o
it =0 Q@
ol SO
Zm_m
<wm2r—-d
T
—
= )
= o
1
= ©
3 ®
=
= )
o
g ¢
% .
>
[ <
QL w
S
=l
z moon -
=l <+ v
3 o B
2|0 <s 3
M o
s/3._"8
TIO=
::OZL‘"S
alz -8
niO2=S
Lt w0 R
Efml_()g._!
- i
H M E e
CTTTTTTTTTTTTTTD
=S
4
-
AL
=2l ix
S| |6
5 o
Slwigd|g
Sla &N E
Q&Juou
Blo2|01¢
Cluwgi8l<
OEL.I,_.I
i A
Vg oclhlo
i, 2|22
>
o)
A AREEE
vammo
O N SN
2I°2i8|=)8
gg“g‘““‘_

|

09-10-08

=4
x
<
=
=
o

[
°

date:
chk. by:

drawing no.

w08-78

sheet 3 of g



mp045
noa23-0928.08

Manny Perez
noa24-1206.01


MULLION CAPACITY CHART - PSF
WINDOW DIMS. STD. MULLION
WIDTH (W) |MULL SPAN| EXT.(+) | INT.(=) %
37-1/2" 120.0 120.0 . .
43-1/2" 120.0 120.0 v 7
. 78" % 2 % 5
49-1/2 120.0 120.0 ¥ 7 & 8z
54" 120.0 120.0 § z 7 g’ &
37-1/2" 120.0 120.0 T ;%
43-1/2" 120.0 120.0 ,
49-1;2" B4 120.0 120.0 % ? % ﬁ 7 j\
4 7 ¥ 7 z
54” 120.0 120.0
37-1/2" 120.0 120.0 ] ]
43-1/2" 00" 120.0 120.0 1-1/2 L 12
49-1/2" 120.0 120.0 W1 " W1 w2
54" 120.0 120.0
37-1/2" 120.0 120.0
43-1/2" 06" 120.0 120.0 WIDTH (W) = _“ﬂ_;Ll”.Z_ +o1-1/27 t
49-1/2" 120.0 120.0 !
54" 120.0 120.0
37-1/2" 120.0 120.0
43-1/27 | 120.0 120.0 f{l} [
49-1/2" 120.0 120.0 = :L}
54" 120.0 120.0
37-1/2" 120.0 120.0
a3-1/2" | 120.0 120.0 (=
49-1/2" 120.0 120.0
54" 118.4 118.4
37-1/2" 120.0 120.0 STD. MULLION
43-1/2" 114" 120.0 120.0
49-1/2" 120.0 120.0 Ix IN“4|SXx IN°3
37-1/2" 120.0 120.0 16.8106] 6.3410
43-1/2" 120" 120.0 120.0
49-1/2" 120.0 120.0

REFER TO SHEET 1 THRU 3 TO OBTAIN CAPACITY OF
EQUAL LITE AND UNEQUAL LITES SINGLE HUNG WINDOWS
AND SINGLE HUNG/FIXED WINDOWS

REFER TO CHARTS ABOVE TO OBTAIN MULLION CAPACITY.

USE LOWEST VALUES OF WINDOW CAPACITY CHARTS OR
MULLION CAPACITY CHART.

NOTE:
FOR ANSI Z97.1 COMPLIANCE LIMIT

MAX. WIDTHS TO 48".

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

24-1206.01

Building Code
NOA-No.

TYPICA VATION

TESTED UNIT

NOA-No.

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida
Building Code

23-0928.08

Expiration Date: %0/25/2025
By:gW A0

Expiration Date: 10/25/2024
By:QW

Miami/—‘pade ProductTontrol

3 2

[

Miami/—Pade Produc,t’Co}trol
227

48" 48"
WINDOW FRAME WIDTH WINDOW FRAME WIDTH
42 7/8" 42 7/8"
D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG.
| 7
@ J MULLION
CORNERS
\5 |
N 1 O N W I O B
e |
i I
¥ It P
-t i T —
CEN L 0 e
6 e === s
i i 4
— i I —
¥ i (HY
. I N7/ (B
= | 1 5/
= o | 11 Ve 1 -
. 155 = s
0 :::::ﬁ:?;i-ﬁi::::
5 12% o

. <25 _] | ! 42 7/8” MAX. -

& r~ It i ip.L, OPG. .
] I ¥ | | %
< | T H 1 i i <@
=\, 1 i I it ! =9
: s :::%F:::::%::: i ¥ E)g
NI —momooigo oo —mo
>iE 1 i :T i -

- I it » —
o g 1 H 43}! :1;://4 MAK‘ o
- 1 i
-8 ¥ /}nmr{g;
g — 5./ 5/ 4 poonne L
— v j—
‘ 7
> t
<E /G . [N ! P 1}
.2 © 0@ &/ N ﬁ} S/ -
| X0 Wooso
H et = sl saftendbneiriusiadpeniieed
SiE 8|3 : i T _
oY - 42 7/8" MAX. ! ’
¥ D.L. OPG. @ ! I
5 | I
— E 5 > b i ——1
, . !
y I R N B Y A i
2 5/8" MAX. é $lok
HEAD /SILL L”E 2 A 7" MAX. 232
CORNERS ' : HEAD/SILL 0| '8
45 1/47 MAX. MULLION ANCHORS
VENT WIDTH SEE SHEET 6

a
(C.A.N. 3538) fC
COMP—ANL\WO08~78RC )

FAX. (305) 262-6978

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33473
TEL. (305) 264-81.00

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

(

|

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

3550 NW. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

TECNOGLASS, LLC

(SERIES PH4400 ALUM SINGLE HUNG WINDOW (L.M.!‘)I

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by [description

nol date
C |oa.14.17
D [09.25.18
£ 111.18.20
F [09.20.23

(revisions:

|

10-08

ate: (g

dr. by: TARIQ
chk. by:

[dote:

T TN
drawing no.

Ww08—-78
sheet 4 of 9



mp045
noa23-0928.08

Manny Perez
noa24-1206.01


EDGE DISTANCE

1BY

- SEE ELEV.

TYPICAL ANCHORS

. WOOD BUCK ) : Nl FOR SPACING -
4 4 ‘g @ ry ) :_} .
B 4 4% . 4 - :‘ 48 s .
2 a b Lo
\\ ‘

WINDOW HEIGHT

D.L. OPG.

SHIM

1/2" MAX
LOAD BEARING

EXTERIOR

©

11/16" NOTCH |

VENT HEIGHT

e o e = SCREEN - OPTIONAL

AT EACH END
-l g

e

. 2 y 2 5

a N < 3! TVPICAL ANCHORSY % |
Lo e oSt SEE ELEV - g

e EDGE DISTANCE  _ FOR SPACING S

SHiM

WINDOW HEIGHT

_EDGE_DISTANCE_
|

METAL
STRUCTURE

BY WOOD BUCK
WA0D STRUCTUR
SHIM

1/2" MAX
[OAD BEARING

\

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEVS.
FOR SPACING

EXTERIOR

|

o~
\
—/
) j
TYPICAL ANCHORS

SEE ELEVS.
FOR SPACING

5

ST T

e —-——SCREEN OPTIONAL

=

P

j--

2

S

i i
e

!
| iH
1», lii ;it

Building Code
NOA-No.

. rr‘ ””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””” =1 .

EDGE % | MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED I
k,% s = || MULLION & MULLION ANCHORS L
. |Z || SEE SEPARATE NOA P

N ! !

S /| A EDGE b

! L\ DISTANCE !

| {

[l 1 | {
LL._. ______ e e e e oo e e .._.)

1 —
T aww ] %

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEVS.
FOR SPACING

18Y OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS AND METAL STRUCTURES NOT BY 'TECNOGLASS’

MUST SUPPORT LOADS IMPOSED BY GLAZING SYSTEM AND

TRANSFER THEM TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida |[NTO METAL STRUCTURE =

TYPICAL ANCHORS: ste £LEV. FOR SPACING

1/4" DIA. KWIK—CON i+ BY 'HILTI (Fu=138 KSI, Fy=137 KSD
INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES
1—1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)

THRU 1BY BUCKS INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS
1-1/4”" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)
1-1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO BLOCKS (JAMBS)

DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE OR BLOCKS
1-3/4” MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)
1—1/4” MIN. EMBED INTO GROUT—FILLED BLOCKS (JAMBS)

1/4" DIA. TEKS OR SELF-DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 5 CRS)
INTO MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS

OR

INTO METAL STRUCTURES (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)

(3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS
ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063—=T5 MIN.)

STEEL: 1/8” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)

(STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED)

EDGE DISTANCE

INTO CONCRETE AND BLOCKS = 2—1/2" MIN.
INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 17 MIN.

3/4" MIN.

24-1206.01 woOD AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS SG = 0.55 MIN.

D.L. OPG.

ey
A (
! ilb {

L w;+E%§

SHIM

3/8" MAX.
LOAD BEARING

N—0/) e
r'*’”“/ﬂ‘/m ! PRODUCT REVISED
S N \ j As complying with the Florida
Building Code
NOA-No.

Expiration Date: 10/25/2024 SR L w Ll
BfWM%mﬁéﬁa

<

e

e/
Ly E ;
"y > =0
P , b
voe iy R \L/ TYPICAL ANCHORS
oA "\-SEE ELEV.

/25/2025 CONCRETE AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS f'c = 3000 PSI MIN.

Expiration Date: 10
3551556 ) C—90 HOLLOW/FILLED BLOCK AT JAMBS f'm =
By: 22 /

Miami/:Dade Produc,t’Co}\trol SEALANT:

2000 PSI MIN.

ALL JOINTS AND FRAME CONNECTIONS SEALED WITH
DOW CORNING 795 SEALANT.

23-0928.08 =y 5 o 2993

i

EDGE DISTANCE FOR SPACING

MiamiéDade Producrco}ltrol

Vg
&
G S
(' T
©
g
Z2 SR>
O- 882
| ©
Z2 =82
¢35 353
Ol o0
oo ¢
Gy %
goe &
[Vt
6318
el
8>N
CeE® g
Goog«
0w
OdLz <
WwE g
zmwow
Ez.aN
<u-|DU-m
u‘mm_:O
TZo0E @
2882,
€ Gz &
N W
T
(2
— ©
= O
= o
= 0
(] My
[ w0
% o~
'8
o 2
= ~
% .
>
F....
WO £
D b
Z|0x
MY N
:)U)@“‘E
2| VT3
oo
Sla. .8
FIOE
=+ PR
T O= 8
C‘—ZO.:n
S
Qamg.
[ o=
%'_P‘")Ep—
S N ——
C D
S
2ie i
Si1G 3
2=l I
S
cioigie
SN
ol @ 2w
SHRE
alal|Elx
al.l.lzlo
>
SHEEE
>
LO
MR EIRE
ped f E D OO O
Qo= | Ni-N
MMVigi|o|~o
*; SO~ O
ggummu_
C
o0
g
(4 o
T &
2 =
PN R
2 Tl
3 55
drawing no.

sheet 5§ of Q



mp045
noa23-0928.08

Manny Perez
noa24-1206.01


3/8" MAX. LOAD BEARING
LOAD BEARING
SHIM
[
| TYPICAL ANCHORS
a SEE ELEV.
SZN = /FOR SPACING
8p\ 1V | .
o \ "
L 4 — - _
4 : \\ /l
i
@ l [ s e
5 L
I'd
. L
(&
v Z
2BY WOOD BUC ] , %
» 0
= [
WOOD STRUCTURE E) \gaay N
e R WOoOD BUCKS — ©
b
N ; i
{
/ EXTERIOR
14
TYPICAL ANCHORS Q
SEE ELEV‘—/ D.L. OPG. : p
FOR SPACING ’
MAX. WINDOW FRAME WIDTH
VENT WIDTH
1/4" MAX. D.L. OPG. \/
SHIM 3/8" MAX.
LOAD BEARING
 — SHIM
3]
§3 1 1/4"
& s o e e B e e e =
B e e et B
—
e B )
TYPICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS |,
SEE ELEV.- » \L-SEE ELEV. o
FOR SPACING v FOR SPACING =z
7
> o
e wSCREEN OPT.| oo e B b
: ()
v Ll
14
EXTERIOR <
-
METAL MAX. WINDOW FRAME WIDTH v
STRUCTURE

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-1206.01

Expiration Date; %0/25/2025
By;!W M

Miam{;l)ade Produc,t’Co)\trol

PRODUCT REVISED

As complying with the Florida

Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0928.08

Expiration Date: 10/25/2024
B:W 1

Miam{—‘Dade Produc,t’Co)ltrol

f
C

COMP—ANL\W08—78RC )

a

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (308) 264-8100

]

FAX. (305) 638-5158

TECNOGLASS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638~5151

[SERIES PH4400 ALUM SINGLE HUNG WINDOW (LM.

|

REV. PER RER COMMENTS
REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
NQ CHANGE THIS SHEET

byl description

11.18.20

D j09.25.18

C 1041417
£
F 109.20.23

nol date

(revisions:

'[

—

09-10-08

g
x
<
| =
3
2
Y
©

hk. by:

date:

g

drawing no.

w0o8-78



mp045
noa23-0928.08

Manny Perez
noa24-1206.01


4’ SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING
. ©

TYPICAL ANCHORS

(’:

|
[
I
|
I
!
|
| &

ﬁ_{m’\__._._

{

e
__J,:J

b
Nk

[ J
U

WINDOW FRAME WIDTH

1 1/2"

WINDOW FRAME WIDTH

n N N
%// | e | ///§4/7Q/;// j ;;/;/
) CONCRETE y , i L
; METAL STRUCTURE x | .
H ‘ l / d
; f i . 1/
T T ; . T 7 eSie) I
Ul Wi Ul e ; U SARY
E !
o@ i |
| p
I j
I i
r (]
% | TYPICAL ANCHORS
| i (3) PER CLIP
| : AT 2” O.C.
i |
I
|
500
{
. . . 500
— — ‘Q\é -
q
1.500
£ 75
&) L
z & é@
MULLION CLIP CONNECTION AT H & SILL

VENT CORNER DETAIL

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-1206.01

Expiration Date: 10/25/2025
ByQW

Miami/:Dade Produc,t’Co}\trol

SEE CHARTS ON SHEET 4 FOR MULLION LOAD CAPACIW‘

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0928.08

Expiration Date: %0/25/2024
By?W M
Miami/—JDade Produc,t’Co)ﬂrol

8P 22203

[ X |

FRAME CORNERS DETAIL

(S
Y ¥ |3
0
© D
o
g
Py
F4 o @I
3] L8|z
=2t 501
=2 45
€= 24)s
g 3 @0
Qo alo
Gpa " ©
o -
Loy %
o I
-
35t
wi el
8>o‘>
Og&® g
Qaog =
O3%Lz 9
mmmog
Eza
guUSL 5
p v o
IEOE@
2885
g Los &
\eemmmsmmmammrmmomsmrmmmssnreid. Severeid
C_ T
—)
= B
= 0
{
=
S 3
o) w
=
= o
o]
2 B
% .
>
I._
Wiow &
O | L
Z|0x
2] 085
51055
<(/)<;.rf“gu;o
sia. "8
31924
IOZL“Q
C‘-ZO._‘%
p—g
@8@3
& 0 =
%P—‘“’)Ee-
M Mmoo
C T
C
2 -
2EIRIE
- vl TR
g(/}o{/)
Slu|Siw
SHEING
HEE
NEFERIES
UQIEI
@18 |8°
CiIZioig|o
fOjlx|jz2 2|2
>
L0
2o [2[]]R
et (WD 0O
Olo|=iN|= |8
wifoidiagi—~o
S Sis | —16
égoouu
C
ol ®
it
oll, o
Thellg
g [
.. 5| &
3 Sy
3 505
| S
SO ——

drawing no.

w08-78
Ghest 7 o7 9)



mp045
noa23-0928.08

Manny Perez
noa24-1206.01


ITEM # PART # REQD. DESCRIPTION MATERIAL | MANF./SUPPLIER/REMARKS
E1 PH4400-001 1 FRAME HEAD 6063-T6 | —

E2 PH4400—002 1 FRAME SILL 6063~T6 | —

E3 PH4400-003 2 FRAME JAMB 6005-T5 | —

E4 PH4400—004 2 VENT JAMB 6063-T6 | —

ES PH4400—-005 1 VENT TOP 6005-T5 | —

£6 PH4400—006 1 MEETING RAIL 8005-T5 | —

E7 PH4400-007 1 VENT BOTTOM 6063~T6 | —

E8 PH4400—-008 1 SILL ANCHOR CLIP 6063~T6 | —

E9 PH4400~-009 1 MEETING SILL 6063-T6 | —

£10 PH4400-010 1 FRAME SILL 3P 8063-T6 | —

E11 PH4400-011A| AS REQD.| MULLIOM 6063-T6 | -

£12 PH4400—012 1 VENT STOP 6063-T6 | AT TOP OF FRAME

£13 500Y-007 | AS REQD.| GLAZING BEAD 6063-T6 | —

£14 500Y-024 | AS REQD.| FEMALE ANCHOR CLIP 6063-T6 | TOP & BOTTOM OF MULLION
E15 500Y-025 | AS REQD.| MALE ANCHOR CLIP 8063-T6 | TOP & BOTTOM OF MULLION
E16 500Y-026 | AS REQD.| EXTRUDED FRAME (OPTIONAL) - -

v2 V071 AS REQD.| VENT BOTTOM WEATHERSEAL VINYL DUROMETER 6545 SHORE A
V3 V=073 AS REQD.| MARINE GLAZING GASKET EPDM DUROMETER 755 SHORE A
s1 AS REQD.| #10 X 1" LG. PH. SMS POINT"B" ST/ST (ASSEMBLY SCREW) - -

52 2/ GUIDE| #8 X 3/8” LG. FH. SMS TYPE "B" ST/ST (@ P-037 & P-013) - -

$3 - 48 X 1/2" LG. P.H. SMS. ST/ST (@ BALANCE BRACKET) - AT BALANCE CLIP

S5 - #8 X 1" LG. FH. SMS ST/ST (@ BALANCE) - AT TOP OF BALANCE

s6 AS REQD.| #14 X 3/4” LG. PH. SMS TYPE "B” ST/ST AT SILL - AT 4" FROM ENDS & 20" O.C. MAX.
s7 - #8-32 X 1/4” LG. PHL. MACHINE SCREW ST/ST - -

H1 2/ WDW. | ULTRALIFT BALANCE - -

H2 2/ WOW. | ULTRALIFT NOT TILT BRACKET - -

M1 P-040 2/ VENT | VENT BOTTOM GUIDE NYLON BOTTOM OF SASH VENT

M2 P-037 2/ VENT | VENT TOP GUIDE NYLON | TOP OF SASH VENT

M3 P-035 2/ WDW. | FINGER LOCK ALUMINUM | AT 6" FROM EACH END

M4 Us6 - Q225T270 BLACK @ VENT JAMBS FOAM -

M5 V—086 - OPERABLE VENT GASKET VINYL -

M6 us2 - Q2507270 WHITE @ MEETING RAIL - -

M7 P—028 - SCREEN RETAINER CLIP-90" ROTATION - -

M10 - 1 1/4" X 1 7/8" X 1/2" HIGH BAFFLE 30 PPl RETIC. W/ADHES AT BOTTOM - -

M11 DC~-995 | AS REQD.| GLAZING COMPOUND SILICONE | DOW CORNING

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-1206.01

Expiration Date: 10/25/2025
ByFWWM@M

Miami/:Dade Produc,t’Co}ltrol

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0928.08

Expiration Date: 10/25/2024
Bme@m

Miamj-Dade Produc,fCo)'atrol

f
C

COMP—ANL\WO08—78RC )

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

LLC

3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMIE, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

TECNOGLASS,

(SER!ES PH4400 ALUM SINGLE HUNG WINDOW (L.M.J

|

]

FAX. (305) 638-5158

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

byTdescription

11.18.20

D 09.25.18

C [04.14.17
E

nol date

(revisions:

F 109.20.23

|

chk. by:

(

isheet 8 of 9



mp045
noa23-0928.08

Manny Perez
noa24-1206.01


-
O
4.188 1.782A——j ‘I U &
r’* {511 ~
e 188 i [¢ m ;
- 2
Z 3kl
E S 0liZ
1.750 [ =z O MG
s =q)4
o} 125 g P =
750 - .078 TYP. o g ARy ]
LI 3.000 o_,g»go
4.188 ga8
4.140 & g LEI E
250 (~ 250 0tao
@) FRAME HEAD 2.219 ] 2219 - i L N RN
| 924 o
2.204 730 1= ‘ % ? g §68< S
] I q-28 9
N ' 5.250 5.250 | OdLE ¢
} gLLo g
750 €ust 5
2.563 Uy .8
Lz 58
€3) FRAME JAMB FEMALE ANCHOR CLIP MALE ANCHOR CLIP T Z25E
o2 -
2.923 i—
1.501
2.376 1.185 r'— _*" (=)
4126 T ) e o217 222 o , = g
T - ] I
=
E: 078 | | : 8 2
TYP. 1.780 1.083 1.116 f £
078 | . 082 750 S 5
TP, 750 =  — i i o 3
D .
E— »Asgal& T = - - %
W QW L
2.151 | ZIau
—=] }=-.100 = JE
MEETING RAIL VENT SIDE RAIL #13)  VENT LATCH GLAZING BEAD 5.300 Sl IR TR
=Rk, - Bh
2.812 2 0¥y
1.780 ‘ 4.013 4.410 e R el s 3.7 8
| g|oz2
MR I % il 2278
750 f 750 [ 7P . nlogs®
o 1.500 | $ ; & | b < J
i 7 656 PRODUCT RENEWED BiFm3E
714 i as complying with the Florida | —
5126 - Building Code =
- 078l L 3278 NOA-No. 24-1206.01
. o k188
- @ STD. MULLION iration Date: 0/25/2025 2lclols
4.265 4.938 .090 Wi miw
. [ =il
i TYP ( }. N
i j—fﬂ 280~ o Mlam —Pade Product Cohtrol c121812
MLE L. FRAME SILL FIXED WOW. S ; = | e RN
; 2.498 . Em«g PRODUCT REVISED SHHEE
4. 1. As complying with the Florida eI
) VENT TOP RAIL 410 1.750 ) | ~050**>E 700 Building Code Sizlc|E)o
s NOA-No. 23-0928.08 =
2.499 :]L .i —= k= .300 %lon Date: 0/25/2024 B =
17 =R
7 | SR
p——— i 3.893 SCREEN F ‘D '8 o~ o
.686 CREEN FRAME Miam Pade Produc,fCo trol 22188
1 v 8 ololwle
3.278 SILL MTG. RAIL W/ FIXED BOTTOM = 1
©y 3.938 o[
(w3
3.187 3.374 .090 3.922 ' & | o
YP. '1 , &
2.437 el 078 2 "
e B
i 7 125 o7 s 5|5
750 @JQ i ( : 3 5%
\_,_M_.__L é —— 375 [_l'_—‘ Qe:sj l} IT} ?‘!67
-‘2,_..'_..——._.-—-1 $ 0 e b i lms P e
) L‘ 4.138 ] ? drawing no.
le———1.780 3.810 W08_78
€7)  VENT BOTTOM RAIL €2) FRAME SILL SILL ANCHOR CLIP (sheet 9 of 9 )



mp045
noa23-0928.08

Manny Perez
noa24-1206.01


	ADPCB00.tmp
	11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208
	Miami, Florida 33175-2474
	Tecnoglass, LLC
	Tecnoglass, LLC
	Tecnoglass, LLC

	ADP12DA.tmp
	11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208
	Miami, Florida 33175-2474
	Tecnoglass, LLC
	Tecnoglass, LLC
	Tecnoglass, LLC




